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Parts & Hardware

1

6.  Table Legs

1.  Main Surface
     (bottom shown)

M6x10mm

3.  Frame
     (short side)

4.  Stretcher Assembly
     (x4 ends / x1 center)

5.  Stretcher Connector
     (bottom shown)

 Trough
 (optional)

2.  Frame
     (long side)

5

4

6

2

3
#8 x 7/8" Panhead

#8 x 3/4" Panhead
(for optional Trough Assembly)
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Instructions

Slide both Table Legs onto the Short 
Frame. 

Fasten the legs to the frame using the 
provided M6x10mm flathead screws. 
Do not fully tighten, only enough to 
keep together. 

Repeat for opposite side.

Slide the Long Frames into the Leg 
brackets on one side only.

Fasten the frame to the legs using the 
provided M6x10mm flathead screws. 
Do not fully tighten, only enough to 
keep together. 

Leave the second piece from Step 1 
unattached.

1

2

Allen Key

Allen Key

M6x10mm

M6x10mm

Qty: 16

Qty: 16
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Instructions

Lay the pieces out for the Stretcher. 
Slide the arms onto the 3-way 
connectors and fasten with the 
provided M6x10mm flathead screws.

Tighten the screws equal amounts 
around the Stretcher until fully tight.

A) With 2 people, install the Stretcher 
in place on one end using the pre-
installed Leg Brackets. 

Fasten with the provided M6x10mm 
flathead screws. 

B) Slide the opposite leg/frame onto 
the long frame so the stretcher can rest 
in place on the leg brackets.

3

4 A

B

Allen Key

Allen Key

M6x10mm

M6x10mm

Qty: 6

Qty: 2
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Instructions

A) Start by fastening the Stretcher to 
the Legs using 2 M6x10mm screws. 

B) Finish by fastening the Leg set up to 
the Long Frames using 8 of the provided 
m6x10mm screws. 

5

Allen KeyM6x10mm
Qty: 10

6
Place the Leg & Frame structure on the 
worksurface. Use caution to not scratch 
the surface.

Center the frame on the worksurface 
and fasten the surface to the Leg 
Brackets using the provided 
#8 x 7/8” Panhead screws. 

It is recommended to insert one screw 
on each corner leg to start. Verify all leg 
tubes are equal distance from surface 
edges - then apply and tighten all 
remaining screws.

Qty: 20
#8 x 7/8" Panhead

A

B
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Instructions

7

#8 x 7/8" Panhead

Continue to fasten the worksurface to 
the frame using the small L brackets 
and provided 7/8” Panhead screws. 
The quantity of screws will depend on 
the length and depth.

Use a power drill as there are no 
pre-drilled holes for this step. 

The Community Table Trough is an 
optional addition, your table may not 
include one. 

Center the trough in the middle of the 
table. Insert 4 screws in the 4 corners 
to mark the position and then remove 
the Trough. Assuming your table has 
Power, you will want to install the 
modules before fastening the trough 
in place. Once installed, you can fully 
fasten the Trough with the provided #8 
x 3/4” Panhead screws. 

Ensure you have the correct screws, 
anything longer than 3/4" will damage 
the top.

#8 x 3/4" Panhead
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